
 

 
 
 
DATE: BID TITLE & REFERENCE: 
November 27, 2013   Art Supplies, Bid #140705 
 
DESCRIPTION OF PURCHASE: 

 
An annual pricing agreement to provide art supplies as stocked and distributed by the Central 
Warehouse to the schools throughout the District. One hundred forty-five (145) items bid and 
awarded. Items will be purchased on an as needed basis to replenish the Central Warehouse 
inventory. Bid award(s) to the lowest bidder(s) meeting specifications. 
  
Effective Dates:  February 1, 2014 through January 31, 2015. 
 
 
 
 

  
REQUESTED BY: 

 
Central Warehouse 
 

    
SUPPLIER NAME:                                                         ITEMS AWARDED:         ESTIMATED ANNUAL EXPENDITURE: 

 
 Dick Blick Company, Galesburg, IL   18                                        $    2,200.00 
 Business Stationers, Montreal, Canada     2                                              1,600.00 
 Commercial Art Supply, Riviera Beach, FL    2                                                 400.00 
 DGS Educational Products, Delray Beach, FL   4                                              1,200.00 
 Pyramid School Products, Tampa, FL   74                                            21,200.00 
 S & S Worldwide, Colchester, CT      2                                                 400.00 
 School Specialty, Greenville, WI    41                                              7,600.00 
 Smith Office, Hollywood, FL       2                                              2,800.00 
    
    
AMOUNT OF PURCHASE: FUNDING SOURCE: 

 
     $37,400.00 Est. / Yr.   General Fund (1110)      
  

   
METHOD OF PROCUREMENT: 

 
ECSD Bid     Responses Received:  15      Bids Rejected:  4  
 

  
DATE AND TIME POSTED: 

 
     November 27, 2013, 3:50 P.M. CST 
 
 
9500PUR101 (11/10) Retention - 5 Years 

 
THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY 

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT 
75 North Pace Boulevard  

Pensacola, FL  32505 
 

BID AWARD NOTICE 



** F=Florida Business; O=Out of State Business
Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% $4.95 $5.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $9.65 $9.65 $8.95 $8.95 $6.95 $6.95 $9.95 $9.95
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.64 $5.92 A, y No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.44 $2.56 $0.98 $1.03 A, NS,12

O School Specialty 5% $4.41 $4.63 $3.05 $3.20 $1.90 $2.00 A, NS $3.05 $3.20
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

5-16 Awarded as a Lot

**

**

Date: 
Bid Number:
Bid Title: 

BID TABULATION

THE SCHOOL DISTRICT OF ESCAMBIA COUNTY
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

1 / Raffia, Natural 3 / Craft Buttons, 1 lb, assorted 

Tuesday, November 12, 2013  2:30 pm
140705
Art Supplies

Recommended Award

75 NORTH PACE BOULEVARD
PENSACOLA, FL 32505

2 / Craft Beads, medium, wood

5 / Ink-Block (Black)

4 / Craft Beads, large, wood
FL. Pref. 

Adj.

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

6 / Ink-Block (Brown) 7 / Ink-Block (Blue) 8 / Ink-Block (Green)
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Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94

F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50 $1.50
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94 $2.80 $2.94
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $1.78 $1.78 A, NS,18 $1.78 $1.78 A, NS,18 $1.78 $1.78 A, NS,18 $1.78 $1.78 A, NS,18
F Pyramid School Products $1.89 $1.89 $1.89 $1.89 $1.89 $1.89 $1.89 $1.89
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid $2.43 $2.55 No Bid No Bid $2.43 $2.55
O S & S Worldwide 5% $0.77 $0.81 A, NS $0.77 $0.81 A, NS $0.77 $0.81 A, NS $0.77 $0.81 A, NS
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17-22 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

13 / Ink-Block (White) 14 / Ink-Block (Yellow) 15 / Ink-Block (Gold) 16 / Ink-Block (Silver)

9 / Ink-Block (Orange) 10 / Ink-Block (Red) 11 / Ink-Block (Turquoise) 12 / Ink-Block (Violet)

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

17 / Yarn (True Blue) 18 / Yarn (Brown) 19 / Yarn (Red) 20 / Yarn (White)

5-16 Awarded as a Lot

5-16 Awarded as a Lot
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.39 $2.51 1 $2.39 $2.51 1
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

F DGS Educational Products $1.78 $1.78 A, NS,18 $1.78 $1.78 A, NS,18 $2.68 $2.68 5 $2.68 $2.68 5

F Pyramid School Products $1.89 $1.89 $1.89 $1.89 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% $2.43 $2.55 $2.43 $2.55 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% $0.77 $0.81 A, NS $0.77 $0.81 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% $2.39 $2.51 1 $2.39 $2.51 1 $2.39 $2.51 1 No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.28 $0.28 A, NS  
F DGS Educational Products $2.68 $2.68 5 $2.68 $2.68 5 $2.68 $2.68 5 $0.65 $0.65
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.32 $0.32
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.14 $0.15 A, NS,13
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% $38.83 $40.77 20 No Bid No Bid $3.84 $4.03 No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid $1.80 $1.80 A, NS No Bid No Bid $8.94 $8.94
F DGS Educational Products $32.95 $32.95 $2.95 $2.95 $7.95 $7.95 $9.55 $9.55
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid $1.30 $1.30 $3.69 $3.69 $8.95 $8.95
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid $9.52 $10.00 A, u No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $16.15 $16.96 $2.40 $2.52 A, NS $3.80 $3.99 $9.40 $9.87
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

17-22 Awarded as a Lot                23-27 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

21 / Yarn (Yellow) 22 / Yarn (Black) 23 / Burlap (Black) 24 / Burlap (Blue)

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

25 / Burlap (Natural) 26 / Burlap (Red) 27 / Burlap (White) 28 / Eraser, Kneaded, Art

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

29 / Linoleum, unmounted 30 / Pencils (#2B) 31 / Fixatif spray (16 oz) 32 / Charcoal sticks
23-27 Awarded as a Lot
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Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid $0.130 $0.137 $0.160 $0.168 $0.350 $0.368
O Business Stationers 5% $0.227 $0.238 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply $0.220 $0.220 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $0.750 $0.750 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.230 $0.230 A, NS $0.290 $0.290 $0.310 $0.310 $0.410 $0.410
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $3.050 $3.203 A, NS $0.300 $0.315 $0.300 $0.315 $0.400 $0.420
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% $0.420 $0.441 $0.450 $0.473 $0.520 $0.546 $0.440 $0.462
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $0.450 $0.450 $0.470 $0.470 $0.500 $0.500 $0.830 $0.830
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $0.450 $0.473 $0.500 $0.525 $0.500 $0.525 No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% $1.95 $2.05 $0.34 $0.36 $0.44 $0.46 $0.21 $0.22
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

34-39 Awarded as a Lot

42 & 43 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

33 / Eraser, Gum 34 / Brush, Camel, Round (#1) 35 / Brush, Camel, Round (#2) 36 / Brush, Camel, Round (#6)

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

37 / Brush, Camel, Round (#8) 38 / Brush, Camel, Round (#10) 39 / Brush, Camel, Round (#12) 40 / Brush, Flat, Black (3/4")

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

41 / Brush, Camel, touch-up (1") 42 / Brush, Flat, Wide (1") 43 / Brush, Flat, Wide (1-1/2") 44 / Brush, Flat, White (#8)
34-39 Awarded as a Lot
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $12.40 $13.02 $12.40 $13.02 $12.40 $13.02 $12.40 $13.02
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $14.95 $5.95 $5.95
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $12.40 $13.02 $12.40 $13.02 $12.40 $13.02 $5.00 $5.25
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.00 $5.25
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $12.95 $12.95
F Pyramid School Products $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.19 $5.19
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $5.00 $5.25 $5.00 $5.25 $5.00 $5.25 $7.10 $7.46
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

45-51 Awarded as a Lot

                                               45-51 Awarded as a Lot              52-55 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

45 / Acrylic, Cool Blue 46 / Acrylic, Black 47 / Acrylic, Cobalt Blue 48 / Acrylic, Green

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

49 / Acrylic, Scarlet Red 50 / Acrylic, White 51 / Acrylic, Light Yellow 52 / Acrylic, Magenta, 16 oz

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

53 / Acrylic, Yellow, 16 oz 54 / Acrylic, Cobalt Blue, 16 oz 55 / Acrylic, Burnt Umber, 16 oz 56 / Gesso Sealer, 32 oz

52-55 Awarded as a Lot
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Bid Item #/Description 

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $14.95 $14.95 $1.88 $1.88 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $7.19 $7.19 $1.18 $1.18 $2.58 $2.58 $2.58 $2.58
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid $1.60 $1.68 $2.60 $2.73 $2.60 $2.73
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $1.80 $1.89 $1.80 $1.89 $1.80 $1.89 $1.80 $1.89
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79 $1.79
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $1.80 $1.89 $1.80 $1.89 $1.80 $1.89 $1.80 $1.89
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

59-71 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

57 / Acrylic Polymer, 32 oz 58 / Watercolor set (washable) 59 / Tempera, White, 32 oz 60 / Tempera, Red, 32 oz

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

61 / Tempera, Black, 16 oz 62 / Tempera, Blue, 16 oz 63 / Tempera, Brown, 16 oz 64 / Tempera, Red, 16 oz

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

65 / Tempera, Green, 16 oz 66 / Tempera, White, 16 oz 67 / Tempera, Yellow, 16 oz 68 / Tempera, Violet, 16 oz
59-71 Awarded as a Lot
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $3.150 $3.150 $3.150 $3.150 $1.79 $1.79 $5.35 $5.35
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $3.150 $3.308 $3.150 $3.308 $1.80 $1.89 No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $5.35 $5.35 $5.35 $5.35 $1.73 $1.73 $1.73 $1.73
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.65 $3.83 $3.65 $3.83
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.75 $1.84 $1.75 $1.84
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.54 $1.54 14, 24 $2.61 $2.61 15, 24, Mu

O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.72 $1.72 $2.91 $2.91
F Pyramid School Products $1.73 $1.73 $1.73 $1.73 $1.49 $1.49 $2.69 $2.69
O Quill 5% $3.65 $3.83 $3.65 $3.83 $1.87 $1.96 No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $1.75 $1.84 $1.75 $1.84 $1.25 $1.31 $3.20 $3.36
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

72-74 Awarded as a Lot             75-78 Awarded as a Lot

75-78 Awarded as a Lot            80-87 Awarded as a Lot

72-74 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

69 / Tempera, Silver, 16 oz 70 / Tempera, Gold, 16 oz 71 / Tempera, Orange, 16 oz 72 / Tempera, Blue (Fluor) 16 oz

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

73/Tempera, Green (Fluor) 16oz 74/Tempera,Orange (Fluor) 16oz 75 / Finger, Blue, 16 oz 76 / Finger, Green, 16 oz

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

77 / Finger, Red, 16 oz 78 / Finger, Yellow, 16 oz 79 / Watercolor, (8 color) 80 / Watercolor, Violet
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $2.61 $2.61 15, 24, Mu $2.61 $2.61 15, 24, Mu $2.61 $2.61 15, 24, Mu $2.61 $2.61 15, 24, Mu

O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $2.91 $2.91 $2.91 $2.91 $2.91 $2.91 $2.91 $2.91
F Pyramid School Products $2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $2.69
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $3.20 $3.36 $3.20 $3.36 $3.20 $3.36 $3.20 $3.36
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $2.61 $2.61 15, 24, Mu $2.61 $2.61 15, 24, Mu $2.61 $2.61 15, 24, Mu No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $2.91 $2.91 $2.91 $2.91 $2.91 $2.91 $3.15 $3.15
F Pyramid School Products $2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $2.69 $1.51 $1.51
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.27 $3.43
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $3.20 $3.36 $3.20 $3.36 $3.20 $3.36 $1.50 $1.58
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid $0.46 $0.46 14, 24 No Bid No Bid $1.62 $1.62 4, 9
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $0.85 $0.85 $0.50 $0.50 $38.40 $38.40 $1.74 $1.74
F Pyramid School Products $0.24 $0.24 $0.37 $0.37 $27.95 $27.95 $1.72 $1.72
O Quill 5% $0.49 $0.51 $0.95 $1.00 $28.39 $29.81 $2.42 $2.54 A, u
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $0.25 $0.26 $0.40 $0.42 $33.00 $34.65 $2.00 $2.10
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

88-93 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

81 / Watercolor, Black 82 / Watercolor, Blue 83 / Watercolor, Green 84 / Watercolor, Turquoise

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

85 / Watercolor, Red 86 / Watercolor, Orange 87 / Watercolor, Yellow 88 / Crayons, Lg, Wax, 16 colors

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

89 / Crayons, 8 colors 90 / Crayons, 16 colors 91 / Crayon Const. Paper, 400 ct 92 / Crayons, Oil  25/bx

88-93 Awarded as a Lot
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.980 $1.980 16
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.085 $2.085
F DGS Educational Products $1.89 $1.89 $3.15 $3.15 $3.15 $3.15 $4.650 $4.650
F Pyramid School Products $1.35 $1.35 $1.99 $1.99 $1.49 $1.49 $2.090 $2.090
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid $2.41 $2.53 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $1.60 $1.68 $2.75 $2.89 $1.50 $1.58 $2.300 $2.415
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.880 $1.880

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid $0.96 $0.96 17, 24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.31 $7.68 A, NS
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $2.44 $2.44 $1.06 $1.06 $4.59 $4.59 $14.48 $14.48
F Pyramid School Products $1.27 $1.27 $0.95 $0.95 $2.58 $2.58 $8.95 $8.95 A, NS
O Quill 5% $1.93 $2.03 $1.47 $1.54 No Bid No Bid $21.49 $22.56
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.06 $7.41 A, NS
O School Specialty 5% $1.25 $1.31 $1.00 $1.05 $3.35 $3.52 $7.20 $7.56
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid $1.09 $1.14 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $17.95 $17.95 $2.15 $2.15 $18.49 $18.49 $2.79 $2.79
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $14.95 $14.95 $2.99 $2.99
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% No Bid No Bid $1.20 $1.26 $13.50 $14.18 $2.00 $2.10
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

102-104 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

93 / Crayon, Fabric  8/bx 94 / Markers, washable  8/bx 95 / Marker, conical tip, 8 colors 96 / Marker Set, fine pt, 10/set

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

97 / Marker Set, bullet tip, 8/set 98 / Color Pencils, 12 colors 99 / Chalk, assorted colors 24/bx 100 / Pipe Cleaner, 1000/box

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

101 / Delete 102 / Wire, stove pipe, 18-gauge 103 / Copper, foils, 36-gauge 104 / Aluminum, foils, 36-gauge

88-93 Awarded as a Lot

Page 9 of 14



Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% $2.61 $2.74 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $3.15 $3.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $4.00 $4.20 A,NS,23 $8.25 $8.66 $12.50 $13.13 $7.10 $7.46
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $8.75 $9.19 $8.25 $8.66 $8.75 $9.19 $8.20 $8.61
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.85 $0.85 21, 24 No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid . $3.51 $3.69
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.35 $1.35 $12.25 $12.25
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.92 $0.92 No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.98 $2.08 No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $10.00 $10.50 A, NS $8.80 $9.24 A, NS $2.10 $2.21 A, NS $3.00 $3.15
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

106-112 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

105 / Tapestry Needles  (#13) 106 / Ceramic Glaze, Green 107 / Ceramic Glaze, Red 108 / Ceramic Glaze, Clear

109/Ceramic Glaze, Turquoise 110 / Ceramic Glaze, Yellow 111 / Ceramic Glaze, Blue 112 / Ceramic Glaze, White

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

113 / Delete 114 / Delete 115 / Clay, Modeling, 4 colors 116 / Clay Tools Set
106-112 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $11.95 $11.95 $5.95 $5.95 $0.49 $0.49 $0.74 $0.74
F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% $1.28 $1.34 A, NS $0.52 $0.55 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $7.25 $7.61 A, NS $3.20 $3.36 A, NS $2.30 $2.42 $3.20 $3.36
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% $2.80 $2.94 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.73 $0.73 A, y
F DGS Educational Products $3.15 $3.15 $4.15 $4.15 $6.75 $6.75 $0.95 $0.95
F Pyramid School Products $3.69 $3.69 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Quill 5% $7.11 $7.47 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% $2.63 $2.76 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $3.70 $3.89 A, NS $2.30 $2.42 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% $2.70 $2.84 A, u $2.70 $2.84 A,u No Bid No Bid $2.70 $2.84 A, u
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95
F Pyramid School Products $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49
O Quill 5% $9.01 $9.46 A, y $9.01 $9.46 A, y $9.01 $9.46 A, y $9.01 $9.46 A, y
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $2.50 $2.63 $2.50 $2.63 $2.50 $2.63 $2.50 $2.63
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

125-132 Awarded as a Lot

FL. Pref. 
Adj.

125 / Glitter, Assorted Colors 126 / Glitter, Blue 127 / Glitter, Diamond Dust 128 / Glitter, Gold
**

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

117 / Delete 118 / Delete 119 / Dowel, White Birch  1/4" 120 / Dowel, White Birch  3/8"

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

121 / Popsicle Stick  1000/box 122 / Clothespin, Wooden 3-1/4" 123 / Delete 124 / Squeeze Bottles, 8 oz
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name
Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% $2.70 $2.84 A, u No Bid No Bid $2.70 $2.84 A, u $2.70 $2.84 A, u
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95 $5.95
F Pyramid School Products $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49 $3.49
O Quill 5% $9.01 $9.46 A, y $9.01 $9.46 A, y $9.01 $9.46 A, y $9.01 $9.46 A, y
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $2.50 $2.63 $2.50 $2.63 $2.50 $2.63 $2.50 $2.63
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.11 $3.27 No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $0.65 $0.65 $8.95 $8.95 No Bid No Bid $2.15 $2.15 21

F Pyramid School Products No Bid No Bid $7.95 $7.95 A, NS, 19 $3.79 $3.79 $1.87 $1.87

O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $1.00 $1.05 $35.00 $36.75 $3.00 $3.15 No Bid No Bid
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% $5.55 $5.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $8.75 $8.75 $4.15 $4.15 $14.65 $14.65 $3.65 $3.65
F Pyramid School Products $6.95 $6.95 $1.79 $1.79 $9.95 $9.95 $1.15 $1.15
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.77 $11.31 No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% $2.63 $2.76 A,NS,22 $2.10 $2.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $4.50 $4.73 $1.65 $1.73 No Bid No Bid $1.10 $1.16
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.48 $7.48 8 No Bid No Bid

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

137 / Glue Sticks, hot melt 138 / Glue, tacky, 8 oz 139 / Glue, school, white 1 gal 140 / Bulletin Board adhesive

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

133 / Watercolor Cup, 2 oz 134 / Sponges, assorted 16/pkg 135 / Adhesive spray 136 / Mounting Adhesive

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

129 / Glitter, Green 130 / Glitter, Purple 131 / Glitter, Red 132 / Glitter, Silver

125-132 Awarded as a Lot
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Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $0.177 $0.177 A, 14, 24 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% $0.137 $0.144 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.70 $2.70 A, NS
F DGS Educational Products $0.230 $0.230 A, u $5.75 $5.75 $8.95 $8.95 $5.50 $5.50
F Pyramid School Products $0.150 $0.150 A, u No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.99 $2.99
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% $0.190 $0.200 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $0.350 $0.368 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.25 $3.41 A, NS
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O Business Stationers 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Commercial Art Supply $0.85 $0.85 A, NS $1.99 $1.99 A, NS $1.30 $1.30 No Bid No Bid
F DGS Educational Products $3.50 $3.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
F Pyramid School Products $1.39 $1.39 $2.09 $2.09 $1.49 $1.49 $5.19 $5.19
O Quill 5% $1.33 $1.40 A, y No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
O School Specialty 5% $1.10 $1.16 A, NS No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $5.15 $5.41
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Bid Item #/Descripton

Bidder Name Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes Bid Price Eval. Price Notes

F AFP Industries $1.270 $1.270 4, 25 $1.270 $1.270 4, 25 $1.590 $1.590 4, 25 $0.00
O Dick Blick Company 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
O Business Stationers 5% $1.000 $1.050 A, u $1.000 $1.050 A, u $1.260 $1.323 A, y $0.00
F Commercial Art Supply No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
F DGS Educational Products $1.570 $1.570 $1.570 $1.570 $1.890 $1.890 $0.00
F Pyramid School Products $1.270 $1.270 $1.270 $1.270 $1.600 $1.600 $0.00
O Quill 5% No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00
O S & S Worldwide 5% No Bid No Bid $1.780 $1.869 A, NS No Bid No Bid $0.00
O School Specialty 5% $1.250 $1.313 $1.250 $1.313 No Bid No Bid $0.00
F Smith Office No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00

144-147 Awarded as a Lot

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

141 / Glue Stick, rub-on 142 / Glue, envelope sealer 143 / Push Pin, Aluminum 144 / Knives, Utility

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

149 / Scissors, Blunt tip 150 / Scissors, Pointed tip 151 / Scissors, Shears /

** FL. Pref. 
Adj.

145 / Blades, Heavy Duty, Refill 146 / Knives, Crafts 147 / Blades, assorted tips 148 / Cutter, Linoleum Set

144-147 Awarded as a Lot
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A =  Alternate bid. Mu = Minimum unacceptable.
E =  Equivalent price. NS = No sample.
G = 1/2 gallon container. u = Alternate product or pack not accepted.
L = 2 liter container. y = Sample accepted.

1 - Blick's item is sold 46" wide.
2 - Blick sells this item in 3 packs. Equivalent pricing.
3 - Did not bid as specified.
4 - Order in multiples of 72.
5 - Order in multiples of 25 yds per color.
6 - Dixon-Prang minimum order is $550.00 (combined).
7 - Minimum order 35 pkgs. 
8 - Minimum order 100 gallons, in full cases, packed 2/case.
9 - Minimum order 288 each.
10 - Minimum order $350.00.
11 - Packed 24/box.
12 - 100 per pack.
13 - Priced and Sold per dozen.
14 - Order in multiples of 144.
15 - Order in multiples of 24.
16 - Minimum order is 504. 
17 - Order in multiples of 48. 
18 - Order in multiples of 12 per color.
19 - Minimum order 30 pkgs, packed 12/pkg.
20 - Packed 3/pkg.
21 - Order in multiples of 12.
22 - 30/pack.
23 - 25/pack.
24 - Minimum order $550.00.
25 - Minimum order $750.00.

BID TABULATION, RECOMMENDATIONS, AND PROTEST
Bid tabulations with award recommendations are posted for 72 hours in the Purchasing Department Office and are also posted to the School District's website address at: 
http://old.escambia.k12.fl.us/adminoff/purchasing/current_bid_activity.html

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in Section 120.57(3) Florida Statutes will constitute a waiver of proceedings under Chapter 120 Florida Statues and School 
Board Rules.  Bid tabulations or recommendations will be distributed solely through the Purchasing website address.  Notices will not be automatically mailed.

I hereby certify that the prices and bidders reflected herein are valid, and have been received in compliance to Escambia County School Board Rules and Florida Law.

John Dombroskie
John Dombroskie, Director
Purchasing Department

NOTES:
Recommend award to lowest overall responsive and responsible Proposer meeting bid specifications.
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